
PRETTY SWEET
$2,150

6 hours of coverage with 
one photographer

Full-resolution digital edited 
images on a flash drive with 
print release

Online photo gallery with 
password protection for 
sharing with friends

Add an Engagement session 
for $300

AWESOMESAUCE
$2,750

Unlimited all day coverage 
with one photographer

Full-resolution digital edited 
images on a flash drive with 
print release

Online photo gallery with 
password protection for 
sharing with friends

Add an Engagement session 
for $300

PERFECTAMUNDO
$3,950

Engagement session

Unlimited all day coverage 
with one photographer

3 consecutive hours of 
coverage with an additional 
photographer

Full-resolution digital edited 
images on a flash drive with 
print release

Online photo gallery with 
password protection for 
sharing with friends

LEGEN-WAIT FOR IT-DARY
$5,450

Engagement session

4 hours photo booth rental 
with premium props and 
attendant

Unlimited all day coverage 
with 2 photographers

Full-resolution digital edited 
images on a flash drive with 
print release

Online photo gallery with 
password protection for 
sharing with friends

*Hourly services available.  Albums and prints available at ala carte prices. 

Each package can be customized to fit your needs.**Minimal travel fees 

may apply outside  of Richmond, VA. See website for more details.

804.627.1729       Linda@Awesomesauce-Photography.com       Awesomesauce-Photography.com


